Attachment 1

City of Pomona
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BID OPENING: April 26, 2017;
Notice posted on website and on Public Notice Board: April 11, 2017

Heavy Duty Truck Parts Los Angeles Truck Centers | Inland Kenworth (US) Inc Rogoarlggrgtlieocérlc ID Industries, LLC gs:gzgéagsmfsﬁz
Bid No. 2017-07 Fontana, CA 92335 Fontana, CA 92335 Kent, WA 98031 Ontario, CA 91761 Anaheim, CA 92806
Item Brand Parth Description Year1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 1 Cost | Year 2 Cost | Year 3 Cost Year1 | Year2 | Year3
Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost
1 Cummins 2872277 |Cam Position Sensor 23.22 20.04 No Bid No Bid
2 Cummins 2872279 |Crank Position Sensor 22.67 19.57 No Bid No Bid
3 Cummins 2897654 |Knock Sensor 93.72 80.44 No Bid No Bid
4 Cummins 3049221 |O-Ring Water Tube 2.48 2.14 No Bid No Bid
5 Cummins 3104230 |Egr Cooler Flange Gasket 29.35 25.27 No Bid No Bid
6 Cummins 3755843 |Gasket, Turbo 6.17 5.31 No Bid No Bid
7 Cummins 3799931RX |Turbocharger 1656.60 1325.28 No Bid No Bid
8 | Cummins | 3033846 |\VastesateActuator 713.09 612.08 No Bid No Bid
Solenoid
9 Cummins 3944593 |Exhaust Manifold Gasket 3.26 2.81 No Bid No Bid
10 Cummins 4089216 |Air Compressor Head Kit 1675.48 1405.36 No Bid No Bid
11 Cummins 4326849 |Oil Pressure Sensor 91.54 78.85 No Bid No Bid
12 Cummins 4352347 |Egr Cooler Kit 501.8 430.72 No Bid No Bid
13 Cummins 4359433  [Electronic Control Module 2750.36 2360.75 No Bid No Bid
14 Cummins 4376312RX |Egr Cooler 1012.82 869.99 No Bid No Bid
15 Cummins 4376358 [Water Pump 162.50 139.98 No Bid No Bid
16 Cummins 4918361 |Jumper Wire 4.68 3.92 No Bid No Bid
17 | Cummins | ag21503 |COMPressor Pressure 135.58 116.42 No Bid No Bid
Sensor
18 Cummins 4936967 |Seal 11.38 9.80 No Bid No Bid
19 Cummins 4944755 |Hose Insulation 7.24 6.24 No Bid No Bid
20 Cummins 4954893 |Oxygen Sensor 210.28 180.49 No Bid No Bid
21 Cummins 4954905 |Cool Temperature Sensor 10.46 9.01 No Bid No Bid
22 Cummins 4955850 |Spark Plug and Boot 39.50 33.91 23.95 23.95 23.95 24.92 24.92 24.92
23 Cummins 4984928 |Mass Air Flow Sensor 149.20 128.06 No Bid No Bid
24 Cummins 4984929 |Egr Pressure Sensor 326.91 280.60 No Bid No Bid
25 Cummins 4989131 |Spark Plug Boot 27.55 23.65 3.50 3.50 3.50 No Bid
26 Cummins 5273379 |Thermostat 39.86 34.34 No Bid No Bid
27 Cummins 5310990 |Ignition Coil 162.34 139.34 No Bid No Bid
28 Cummins 5316185 |Exhaust Manifold Gasket 44.12 37.87 No Bid No Bid
29 Cummins 5320525 |Ignition Control Module 1550.05 1330.51 No Bid No Bid
30 Cummins 5320969 |Harness, Module to Coils 155.20 133.21 No Bid No Bid
31 Gunite 3600AX  |Brake Drum 16.50 x 7.00 117.22 128.33 No Bid 82.5882 82.5882 82.5882
32 Gunite 3687X Brake Drum 16.50 x 6.00 117.22 292.65 No Bid 81.53 81.53 81.53
33 | Hendrickson | 64179-048 |Bolster Spring Service Kit 213.84 308.09 No Bid 100.1584 | 100.1584 | 100.1584
SUM 3170.99 3066.30 27.45 27.45 | 27.45 | 289.1966 | 289.1966 | 289.1966
. . - Cummins National Fleet Net . -
Percenta}ge dlsc?unt_ off the manufacturere's prt?vallmg Hendrickson List 60% Gunite 27-28% OFf List 20% 30% 28% AIhson Original
published price list for other parts not specified: List 0% Equipment Parts
Do you offer online ordering? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
* Prices adjustments are
dependant upon manufactures
price adjustments. Vendor will
notify the City 30 days prior to
any increases or decreases.
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