
Attachment 1

SUMMARY OF BIDS

BID OPENING : September 12, 2018; 3:00pm

Item Qty Description
 Unit 

 Est. Annual Cost Per Meter 
Size 

 Unit 
 Est. Annual Cost Per 

Meter Size 
 Unit 

 Est. Annual Cost Per 
Meter Size 

 Unit 
 Est. Annual Cost Per 

Meter Size 
 Unit 

 Est. Annual Cost Per 
Meter Size 

 Unit 
 Est. Annual Cost 

Per Meter Size 

20 3 Inch  Meters $3,694.00 $73,880.00 No Bid $1,975.00 $39,500.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $752.27 $15,045.40 
12 4 Inch Meters $4,506.00 $54,072.00 No Bid $2,575.00 $30,900.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $802.27 $9,627.24 
6 6 Inch Meters $4,051.00 $24,306.00 No Bid $4,875.00 $29,250.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $765.00 $4,590.00 
1 8 Inch Meters $4,823.00 $4,823.00 No Bid $6,575.00 $6,575.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $828.00 $828.00 
1 10 Inch Meters $5,569.00 $5,569.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $891.00 $891.00 

$162,650.00 $106,225.00 $30,981.64 

20 3 Inch  Meters $3,001.00 $60,020.00 $1,472.10 $29,442.00 $1,975.00 $39,500.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
12 4 Inch Meters $3,317.00 $39,804.00 $2,045.95 $24,551.40 $2,575.00 $30,900.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
6 6 Inch Meters $4,853.00 $29,118.00 $3,444.45 $20,666.70 $4,875.00 $29,250.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
1 8 Inch Meters $6,028.00 $6,028.00 $8,074.20 $8,074.20 $6,575.00 $6,575.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
1 10 Inch Meters $7,400.00 $7,400.00 $8,523.83 $8,523.83 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

$142,370.00 $91,258.13 $106,225.00

7 3 Inch Meters $535.06 $3,745.42 $688.90 $4,822.30 $785.00 $5,495.00 No Bid $917.65 $6,423.55 $415.05 2,905.35              

20 3 Inch  Meters NO Bid $1,472.10 $29,442.00 $1,605.00 $32,100.00 $2,035.04 $40,700.80 $1,915.41 $38,308.20 No Bid
12 4 Inch Meters NO Bid $2,045.95 $24,551.40 $1,850.00 $22,200.00 $2,255.68 $27,068.16 $2,219.82 $26,637.84 No Bid
6 6 Inch Meters NO Bid $3,444.45 $20,666.70 $2,725.00 $16,350.00 $3,708.32 $22,249.92 $3,778.94 $22,673.64 No Bid
1 8 Inch Meters NO Bid $8,074.20 $8,074.20 $3,475.00 $3,475.00 $5,780.32 $5,780.32 $5,537.12 $5,537.12 No Bid
1 10 Inch Meters NO Bid $8,523.83 $8,523.83 $6,675.00 $6,675.00 $8,048.32 $8,048.32 $6,585.35 $6,585.35 No Bid

$91,258.13 $80,800.00 $103,847.52 $99,742.15

20 3 Inch  Meters No Bid No Bid $1,605.00 $32,100.00 See Above $2,074.24 $41,484.80 No Bid
12 4 Inch Meters No Bid No Bid $1,850.00 $22,200.00 See Above $2,378.65 $28,543.80 No Bid
6 6 Inch Meters No Bid No Bid $2,725.00 $16,350.00 See Above $3,943.06 $23,658.36 No Bid
1 8 Inch Meters No Bid No Bid $3,475.00 $3,475.00 See Above $5,695.94 $5,695.94 No Bid
1 10 Inch Meters No Bid No Bid $6,675.00 $6,675.00 See Above $6,744.18 $6,744.18 No Bid

$80,800.00 $106,127.08

Subtotal $308,765.42 $187,338.56 $192,520.00 $103,847.52 $212,292.78 $33,886.99

Sales Tax $29,332.71 $17,797.16 $18,289.40 $9,865.51 $20,167.81 $3,219.26

Total $338,098.13 $205,135.72 $210,809.40 $113,713.03 $232,460.59 $37,106.25

 Elster AMCO Water, LLC 
 Badger Meter, Inc. DBA National Meter 

& Automation 
 Mountain States Pipe & Supply 

Large Cold Water  - UL

Large Cold Water - FM

Large Cold Water - Construction (without Encoded Registers)

 Zenner Performance Meters, Inc. 
(dba Zenner USA) 

 Core & Main LP 
Large Cold Water Meters 
Bid No. 2018-18  S&J Supply 

Large Cold Water  - Non UL

Large Cold Water - Non FM

Category Sub Total:

Category Sub Total:

Category Sub Total:

Category Sub Total:


