CITY OF POMONA

SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

IFB # 2020-1023: Sodium Hydrochloris Acid

Pacific _Star Univar USA Waterlin_e e e
Chemical Technologies
PURCHASE She(;\:onod, Kent, WA Santa Ana, CA Saugus, CA

Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
1 Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% - Per Gallon- Year 1 $ 1.39 | no bid 1.26 1.17
2 Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% - Per Gallon- Year 2 $ 1.43 | no bid 1.31 1.20
3 Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% - Per Gallon- Year 3 $ 1.49 | no bid 1.36 1.23
$ 431|$ = 3.93 3.60
4 Hydrochloris Acid 12.5% - Year 1 no bid $ 3,186.00 4.04 2.83
5 Hydrochloris Acid 12.5% - Year 2 no bid no bid 4.19 2.87
6 Hydrochloris Acid 12.5% - Year 3 no bid no bid 4.28 2.90
BRAND NEW TOTAL $ = $ 3,186.00 12.51 8.60
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